



Republic of the Philippines
WESTERN MINDANAO STATE UNIVERSITY
Zamboanga City



ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATION/S OF SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF VARIOUS HARDWARE SUPPLIES AND MATERIALS FOR THE OFFICE OF THE PRESIDENT
and was opened at Western Mindanao State University on:
PR-22-01-031; SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT
January 24, 2022

I hereby certify that the notice below stated procurement opportunity has been posted, as required by the Rules and Regulations, and that it has been posted, as required by the Rules and Regulations, and that it has been posted, as required by the Rules and Regulations.

RUSSELL I. INKHO, PH.D.
Head Office President

Item No.	Qty	Unit	Article/s	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	DELIVERY PERIOD	SK ENTERPRISES		DL HARDWARE & CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY		DENNIS HARDWARE AND ENTERPRISES, INC.		WILCON DEPOT		CENTURY LIGHTS CENTER				
						DESCRIPTION	TOTAL	DESCRIPTION	TOTAL	DESCRIPTION	TOTAL	DESCRIPTION	TOTAL	DESCRIPTION	TOTAL			
1	5	pieces	2" x 3" TUBULAR Length 6 meter, Steel	Php 4,750.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	950.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	1,175.00	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	105.00	1.2W	1,988.50	1" x 3" - 13 FEET	9,842.50	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	4,380.00	22,650.00
2	1	roll	WALL PAPER	Php 1,500.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	1,500.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	N/A	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	NO BID	NO BID	746.50	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	746.50	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	NO BID	NO BID
3	1	pieces	WOOD design, 10m/roll	Php 340.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	340.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	N/A	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	NO BID	NO BID	330.00	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	330.00	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	NO BID	NO BID
4	2	pieces	STICKER ADHESIVE	Php 340.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	340.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	N/A	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	NO BID	NO BID	237.00	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	474.00	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	NO BID	NO BID
5	100	pieces	4" METAL CUT OFF	Php 260.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	260.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	240.00	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	26.70	53.40	237.00	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	474.00	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	NO BID	NO BID
6	2	pieces	2" TEXSCREW	Php 300.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	300.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	200.00	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	128.00	128.00	147.50	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	14,750.00	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	135	135.00
7	2	pieces	NO MORE NAILS	Php 500.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	500.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	180.00	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	79.75	159.50	249.00	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	498.00	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	NO BID	NO BID
8	4	sets	TELEPHONE CONNECTING BLOCK	Php 750.00	10 Days	Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	750.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	N/A	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	NO BID	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	NO BID	NO BID
SUB-TOTAL				Php 8,410.00		Philips Reference Number - 2056101874129326573	8,410.00	Philips Reference Number - 599-2989	6,495.00	Philips Reference Number - 200707151272141318455	865.90	865.90	26,641.00	2 THRS OF WOOD DESIGN	26,641.00	Philips Reference Number - SKINNESS	22,785.00	22,785.00

Atty. General (Consultant bid)

TO

SK Enterprises

Resolved to declare the above stated items to be the lowest calculated bid (LCB) subject to final Qualification Evaluation.

Requisitioner/s: **ATTY. JULES CHRISTIAN D. MARCOS** (Member)
 Requisitioner/s: **MR. JOHN PAUL S. ALVAREZ** (Member)
 Requisitioner/s: **ENGR. OSCAR M. CASIBURO** (Member)
 Requisitioner/s: **ENGR. ANTONIO ANGELO J. LIMBAGA** (Member)
 Requisitioner/s: **ENGR. CATHERINE D. FALCAGANTOS** (Member)
 Requisitioner/s: **MOHAMMAD NUR S. FENYASSAN, PHD** (Member)
 Requisitioner/s: **CAROLINA E. TEJERO** (Chair)
 Requisitioner/s: **JODEL FERNANDO, PHD** (Chair)
 Requisitioner/s: **MA. CARLA A. OCHOAORENA, RN, PHD** (President)

JAN 27 2022
8:47



Republic of the Philippines
WESTERN MINDANAO STATE UNIVERSITY
Zamboanga City



I hereby certify that the notice below stated procurement opportunity/ies have been posted, as required by the Rules and Regulations of RA 9181.

RUSSELLA USIGON, PhD.
Head, Bid Secretariat

ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATION(S) OF SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF VARIOUS HARDWARE SUPPLIES AND MATERIALS FOR THE OFFICE OF THE PRESIDENT
and was opened at Western Mindanao State University on:
PR-22-01-031; SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT
January 24, 2022

Item No.	Unit	Article/s	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	DELIVERY PERIOD	S1 ENTERPRISES		DL HARDWARE & CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY		DENNIS HARDWARE AND ENTERPRISES, INC.		WILCON DEPOT		CENTRIFUGHS CENTER	
					Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	TOTAL	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	TOTAL	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	TOTAL	Philgas Reference Number -	TOTAL	Philgas Reference Number -	TOTAL
3	pieces	SWITCH BOX	1,080.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	8,410.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	6,495.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	855.90	Philgas Reference Number -	25,641.00	Philgas Reference Number -	22,785.00
4	pieces	3/4" PVC RIGID BOLLING	480.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	1,200.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	960.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	190.00	Philgas Reference Number -	368.00	Philgas Reference Number -	160.00
9	pieces	for telephone	480.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	1,200.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	960.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	320.00	Philgas Reference Number -	368.00	Philgas Reference Number -	NO BID
10	meters	#14 THHN WIRE STRANDED	1,200.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	1,200.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	960.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	1,008.00	Philgas Reference Number -	1,608.00	Philgas Reference Number -	888.00
11	pieces	4" PIN LIGHT DAYLIGHT	3,240.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	3,240.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	2,317.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	2,317.00	Philgas Reference Number -	1,297.50	Philgas Reference Number -	1,100.00
12	pieces	STRIP LIGHT CONNECTOR	600.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	600.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	NO BID	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	NO BID	Philgas Reference Number -	4,539.04	Philgas Reference Number -	420.00
13	meters	STRIP LIGHT Warm White Color	4,950.00	10 Days	Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	4,950.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	N/S	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	N/S	Philgas Reference Number -	10,170.00	Philgas Reference Number -	4,800.00
TOTAL					Philgas Reference Number - 2016101824292929292929	19,940.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	15,960.00	Philgas Reference Number - 2007075278131518456	7,615.00	Philgas Reference Number -	44,855.54	Philgas Reference Number -	30,133.00

Lot amount (complete bid)

TO

SK Enterprises

Resolved to declare the above stated items to be the lowest Circumscribed Bid (CCB) subject to Post Qualification Evaluation.

Atty. Jules Christian D. Marcos
West Chairman
MR. JOHN PAUL S. ALVAREZ
Member
ENGR. OSCAR T. MARIBO
Member
ENGR. ANTONIO ANGELO J. LIMBAGA
Member
ENGR. CATHERINE D. FACASANTOS
Member
MOHAMMAD NUR S. VASPRAN, PhD
Member

Regulator/Chair
CAROLINA L. TERERO
Regulator
JOSE G. FERNANDO, PhD
Chair
Approved by:
MA CARLA A. OCHOAORENA, RN, PhD
President